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1 0 - 1,500 EA 5/8" X 3/4" Disc No Bid No Bid - $72.54 $123.40 6 Working Days ARO No Bid $261.82 7 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $62.63* $110.43* 21 days

2 0 - 1,500 EA 1" Disc No Bid No Bid - $206.35 $257.21 6 Working Days ARO No Bid $525.14 7 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $138.57* $186.36* 21 days

3 0 - 150 EA 1-1/2" Disc
No Bid $552.74* 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
$355.76 $406.62 10 Working Days ARO No Bid $819.18 14 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $382.60* $430.40* 21 days

4 0 - 150 EA 2" Disc
No Bid $721.52* 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
$519.33 $570.20 10 Working Days ARO No Bid $1,141.09 14 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $470.85* $518.65* 21 days

5 0 - 50 EA 1-1/2" Compound Meters
No Bid $1,309.10* 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid No Bid - No Bid $2,669.37 49 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $2,153.23 No Bid 84 days No Bid No Bid -

6 0 - 50 EA 2" Compound Meters
No Bid $1,505.48 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid No Bid - No Bid $3,069.64 49 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $2,468.60 No Bid 84 days $772.58* $883.07* 25 days

7 0 - 25 EA 3" Compound Meters
No Bid $1,898.24 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid No Bid - No Bid $3,871.55 56 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $3,100.44 No Bid 84 days $804.25* $914.75* 25 days

8 0 - 25 EA 4" Compound Meters
No Bid $3,272.95 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid No Bid - No Bid $6,674.78 56 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $5,309.15 No Bid 84 days $924.17* $1,050.24* 25 days

9 0 - 3 EA 6" Compound Meters
No Bid $5,629.57 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid No Bid - No Bid $11,480.76 98 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $9,095.83 No Bid 84 days $5,769.44* $5,848.61* 25 days

10 0 - 50 EA 2" Turbine Meters
No Bid $1,068.78 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid No Bid - No Bid $2,179.38 49 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $1,767.16 No Bid 84 days $378.44* $514.96* 25 days

11 0 - 10 EA 3" Turbine Meters
No Bid $1,323.84 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid No Bid - No Bid $2,699.73 56 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $2,177.15 No Bid 84 days $476.26* $612.78* 25 days

12 0 - 10 EA 4" Turbine Meters
No Bid $2,546.40 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid No Bid - No Bid $5,192.43 56 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $4,171.18 No Bid 84 days $509.98* $646.51* 25 days

13 0 - 2 EA 6" Turbine Meters
No Bid $4,558.29 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid No Bid - No Bid $9,295.85 98 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $7,414.32 No Bid 84 days $849.54* $986.07* 25 days

14 0 - 2 EA 8" Turbine Meters
No Bid $8,481.05 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid No Bid - No Bid $17,295.64 112 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $13,747.47 No Bid 84 days $1,307.98* $1,444.51* 25 days

15 0 - 2 EA 10" Turbine Meters
No Bid $11,047.67 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid No Bid - No Bid $22,529.47 112 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $17,851.27 No Bid 84 days $1,769.49* $1,906.01* 25 days

16 0-200 EA 5/8" X 3/4" Ultrasonic
No Bid $155.44* 4 Weeks (28 days)

Plus Shipping
No Bid $174.24 6 Working Days ARO No Bid $319.26 7 days No Bid $174.42** 30 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $90.95* $148.43* 25 days

17 0-200 EA 1" Ultrasonic
No Bid $244.77* 4 Weeks (28 days)

Plus Shipping
No Bid $224.07 6 Working Days ARO No Bid $405.13 7 days No Bid $244.19** 30 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $113.04* $170.52* 25 days

18 0 - 50 EA 1-1/2" Ultrasonic Meters
No Bid $1,498.79* 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid $526.68 15 Days ARO No Bid $926.67 28 days No Bid $628.00** 30 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $239.08* $304.77* 25 days

19 0 - 50 EA 2" Ultrasonic Meters
No Bid $1,590.87* 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid $757.02 30 Days ARO No Bid $1,238.35 28 days No Bid $750.00** 30 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $288.44* $354.14* 25 days

20 0 - 25 EA 3" Ultrasonic Meters
No Bid $2,197.25* 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid $1,997.82 Up to 25 pieces 20 weeks 

(140 days) ARO
No Bid $3,406.15 14 days No Bid $2,134.00** 60 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $1,013.61* $1,172.68* 25 days

21 0 - 10 EA 4" Ultrasonic Meters
No Bid $3,457.07* 5 Weeks (35 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid $2,428.47 Up to 25 pieces 20 weeks 

(140 days) ARO
No Bid $4,148.04 14 days No Bid $2,732.00** 60 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $1,138.47* $1,297.54* 25 days

22 0 - 2 EA 6" Ultrasonic Meters
No Bid $5,202.06* 12 Weeks (84 days)

Plus Shipping
No Bid $3,792.36 15 Days ARO No Bid $6,196.09 14 days No Bid $4,600.00** 60 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $1,868.72* $1,989.86* 25 days

23 0 - 2 EA 8" Ultrasonic Meters
No Bid $8,977.00* 12 Weeks (84 days)

Plus Shipping
No Bid $4,416.39 15 Days ARO No Bid $7,630.47 14 days No Bid $7,073.00** 120 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $2,528.68* $2,591.78* 25 days

24 0 - 2 EA 10" Ultrasonic Meters No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - No Bid $8,830.00** 120 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $3,428.41* $3,537.66* 25 days

25 0 - 250 EA 1" Domestic Fire Meters
No Bid $277.29* 6 Weeks (42 days) 

Plus Shipping
No Bid $237.27 6 Working Days ARO No Bid $546.57 56 days No Bid $244.19** 30 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $190.70* $247.49* 25 days

26 0 - 25 EA 2" Domestic Fire Meters No Bid No Bid - No Bid $815.10 100 Days ARO No Bid $1,338.45 7 days No Bid $750.00** 30 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $409.11* $465.90* 25 days

27 0 - 25 EA 3" Fire Hydrant Meter W/Backflow
No Bid No Bid - No Bid $3,822.90* Up to 25 pieces 30 weeks 

(210 days) ARO
No Bid $11,628.77 14 days No Bid No Bid - $3,383.00 No Bid 4-8 weeks (28-56 days) $8,188.42*** No Bid 14 days $2,673.21* $2,773.21* 25 days

28 0 - 25 EA 2" Strainers
No Bid No Bid - No Bid $471.10 Up to 25 pieces 25 weeks 

(175 days) ARO
No Bid $784.49 49 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $146.89* No Bid 25 days

29 0 - 5 EA 4" Strainers
No Bid No Bid - No Bid $875.70 Up to 25 pieces 25 weeks 

(175 days) ARO
No Bid $1,441.96 49 days No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid - $272.43* No Bid 25 days

* Water meter model provided is not pre‑approved by the City; pricing for this 
item will not be considered.
** This is a bid pricing specific to Neptune Technology Group's water meter 
models specified in the RFP's Scope of Work.
*** Required water meter model specification was not submitted; pricing for 
this line item will not be considered.

Vendor Bid Comparison Chart Aqua-Metric Sales Company (Thirkettle) Integrated Power System LLC (IPS)
BID RESULTS RFP #2526-RFP, WATER METERS - CITY OF FULLERTON - MARCH 2026

Zenner USA, Inc.Badger Meter, Inc. Blue Angel International LLC. Ferguson Waterworks iFlow Inc.


